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The idea of big bank bosses regarding me as a fantasist who thinks they will some how 
pass some of their money down my way is nonsense based heavily on refusing to work 
with what the truth is. I have been clear however about the fact I will not tolerate 
anybody spending my equities which I have placed in their companies at the stock 
exchange and if they fall on difficult circumstances and feel they have to they must 
express their own act of equity towards me by finding a distributor somewhere and 
getting copies of my books distributed by which they send the amount of money 
intended to be a factor of their act of equity to my bank account, to inform me of which 
business has done it can be followed on with advertisement which just helps them even 
further. I am not playing games with anybody and will never go about solving problems 
while they pay themselves big bonuses-no body spends my securities, I am clear enough 
about that.  
 
When they want things from me, they flatter me to get it or send media people to use 
media to get it from me for them whether I like it or not pretending it belongs to them as 
well when finished and when I need my funds make out all I have is paper and it will 
never do, it is seriously insulting and a story that is very familiar too. 



I mean what would a big banking group  gain for having the exclusive distributor rights 
of my books in say Asia or Russia? 
 
To the effect of what I have done here, I expect people to push for the sale of my books 
in order to work with their margins, in order to save money on advertisement to reward 
their customers. They were supposed to have a government that checked what the 
structure they had for paying dividends to their shareholders was, before giving them 
tax payers money to play around with but did not have a government that did that. 
‘Don’t spend my securities’ is simple enough for anybody to understand and certainly 
not a fantasy. It is a clear and active process of working with me  not stupid rich boy fun 
and games; if they feel they want to gather information from my books without buying 
them, I would have supposed we have come through that anyway as they will create for 
themselves Orphan investments all over the place, plus my books do not mince their 
words on the problems of society. 
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